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115 Pets

Airdale Terrier Puppies 
AKC, big, healthy, protective, 
friendly, faithful companions, 
hypoallergenic, doesn’t shed, 
indoor/outdoor. Powell, WY. 

Also a 10 month old available. 
307-219-2217 or  

719-217-8054 

140 Services Offered

In-Home Pet Sitting in 
Thermopolis! 

Countryside Grooming & 
Boarding with decades of 
experience caring for your 

pets is Insured, background 
checked, and Pet First Aid & 

CPR certified. 
Call us at 921-9324 or 

431-8336! Your furry friends 
deserve the best!

Home repairs, windows, 
 doors, siding, etc. Val Gibson 

347-8546.

AAA Water Damage  
Restoration LLC

Carpet, Area Rug and  
Upholstery Cleaning. Duct 
and Dryer Vent Cleaning. 

Flood, Fire, Mold and Sewer 
Back-up Remediation. 

 Post Construction Cleaning.
Office 307-347-8668
Cell  307-388-2426

Don Vail Construction  
New construction, remodel, 

windows, doors, siding.  
30+ years experience!  
Call Don: 347-6538 or  

431-5982 or Jeff: 431-1723.

FINE JEWELRY & REPAIR
My Little Spot Jewelry

1600 Big Horn, Worland
347-2220

*ELMER & YVONNE’S*
Repairs, vacuums, sewing 

machines, and lamps. 
*50 YEARS EXPERIENCE*
1261A Lane 14 - Worland

307-347-2095

TREE SERVICE - Trim, cut 
down and removal. Insured, 
experienced. Steve Shryack 
388-0994

ROOF LEAKING?
Call Stellar Roofing

(Local business for over  
10 years)

We work with all insurance
companies

Estimates are FREE!
Licensed and Insured
Call: 307-347-3289 or

307-431-9188

REACH THOUSANDS with a 
WY Classified Advertising 
Network. For sale, services, 
help wanted, auctions and 
more! Advertise statewide for 
only $150. Contact your local 
newspaper.       

140 Services Offered

UNITED Pawn Brokers. Fast 
cash for that financial emer-
gency. 515 South Railway 
Street. 347-2055.

TWO KINGS FLOORING
Call us for all your  
installation needs.
Chuck King 307-431-4544
Kenton King 307-389-1975
“WHERE EXPERIENCE 

MATTERS”

160 Help Wanted

GREAT AND FUN PLACE 
TO WORK…. OWL Unlim-
ited has both part-time and 
full-time openings. The DCP 
(Direct Care Provider) would 
work directly with the partic-
ipants (individuals with dis-
abilities). We provide different 
service such as Day Habilita-
tion, Residential Habilitation, 
Supported Employment, 
Supported living, Respite, 
etc... The DCP will have an 
opportunity to be involved in 
different activities and trips 
with the participants. Starting 
wage at $14.00 or higher de-
pending on experience. We 
offer health and dental insur-
ance after 90 days. We have 
different employee incentives 
such as wage increase over 
insurance if you choose. Va-
cation days after 90 days. 
Turn in an application and 
let’s chat about what works 
for you and us to make you 
part of an awesome team. 
If you would like to join our 
fun team ....apply in person 
by picking up an application 
at 151 S. 6th Street in Wor-
land or visit the website www.
owlunlimited.com and fill out 
an application.

Hiring all positions - Travel 
Lodge & Econo Inn. Pick up 
application 1115 Big Horn 
Ave/ McKinnon Flooring. 
Bring in or email resume brit-
tani@mckinnonflooring.com. 
Call 307-347-3289 for any 
questions.

The Washakie County Clerk’s 
Office is accepting applica-
tions for a full time Deputy 
Clerk to provide exceptional 
customer service and sup-
port daily office operations. 
The ideal candidate will have 
excellent communication and 
customer service skills, pro-
ficiency with office software, 
the ability to multitask, and 
strong organizational skills 
with attention to detail. If you 
are detail-oriented and en-
joy serving our community, 
please contact the Washakie 
County Clerk’s Office at 1001 
Big Horn Ave., Worland, WY 
82401 – Details online at 
www.washakiecounty.net. 
Applications will be accepted 
through February 21, 2024 at 
5:00 pm

160 Help Wanted

Certified K-6/5-8 and/or 
Special Education Teach-
er position open @ NW 
BOCES/Big Horn Basin Chil-
dren’s Center in Thermopo-
lis.  Students K-8.    Join an 
educational and treatment 
team providing high-quality 
instruction and therapy ser-
vices to youth ages 5-14.  
Engage students to promote 
their social, emotional, and 
academic development.  Col-
laborate with team members 
to provide positive reinforce-
ment within an individualized 
education plan (IEP). Enjoy 
a small class size with full-
time paraeducator support.  
Join our team to help make 
a difference in the lives of the 
youth we serve. Competitive 
salary and benefits package.  
For more info:  call 307-864-
2171 or check our web site 
www.nwboces.com.

Green Hills Golf Course is 
accepting applications for  
part-time pro shop employ-
ees. for the 2025 golf season. 
Position is for April through 
October 2025. Responsibili-
ties include checking in golf-
ers, handling money, selling 
merchandise, cleaning and 
parking golf carts. Golf and 
computer experience pre-
ferred, but will train the right 
person. 5-6 hours/day and 
could include weekends. Ap-
plications can be obtained 
by sending an email to  
dbjorhus@pga.com.

200 For Rent

Quiet 2 bedroom in Ten Sleep, 
AC, Dishwasher. No Smoking. 
No Pets. $650. 307-272-0219

Nice 1 bedroom house with 
appliances. No smoking, no 
pets. $700.00 monthly plus 

security deposit. 
406-853-1392

200 For Rent

Storage Units Available  
Now in Thermopolis

100 sf for $75 per month
Call Grand Storage 

307-921-2611

280 Real Estate

HOME FOR SALE
3 bedroom, plus 2 bath. 

 2 city lots, garage, Basin, WY
$275,000

307-752-8803
307-250-2718

290 Livestock & 
Feed

Barley Straw Certified Weed 
Free- Small Squares $4.00 
per bale. Certified round 
bales too. Greybull area. 307-
762-3878 or 307-899-4714. 
Leave message

GRASS HAY Organically 
Grown - 3’x4’x8’ bale - $48/
bale, weed released, call 
307-762-3536.

320 For Sale

Large Buffalo Hide $500.00. 
Snowblade fits 2007 700  

Yamaha, like new $300.00
347-3804

330 Miscellaneous

A.A. meetings 
Tues/Thurs 7pm  

Methodist Church 
1301 Big Horn Ave 

GOT WRINKLES?
IN YOUR CARPET?
WE CAN FIX THEM!

TWO KINGS FLOORING
Chuck King 307-431-4544
Kenton King 307-389-1975
“WHERE EXPERIENCE 

MATTERS”

Get FREE EMAIL NOTIFICA-
TIONS on routinely searched 
public notices, save search 
criteria, print multiple notic-
es simultaneously, or receive 
automatic search results dai-
ly at wyopublicnotices.com.  
Monitor government actions 
like hearings, meetings, min-
utes, budgets, taxes, bids, 
elections, zoning, foreclo-
sures and more in print and 
online published by your 
community newspaper, and 
SEARCH FOR FREE online 
at wyopublicnotices.com.    

We buy 8,000 cars a week. 
Sell your old, busted or junk 
car with no hoops, haggles 
or headaches. Sell your car 
to Peddle. Easy three step 
process. Instant offer. Free 
pickup. Fast payment. Call 
1-877-582-0070                  

330 Miscellaneous

We Buy Houses for Cash AS 
IS!  No repairs. No fuss. Any 
condition. Easy three step 
process: Call, get cash offer 
and get paid. Get your fair 
cash offer today by calling 
Liz Buys Houses: 1-866-759-
0710.             

Stroke and Cardiovascular 
disease are leading causes 
of death, according to the 
American Heart Associa-
tion. Screenings can pro-
vide peace of mind or early 
detection! Contact Life Line 
Screening to schedule your 
screening. Special offer - 5 
screenings for just $149. Call 
1-844-735-3471.         

400 For Sale: Autos

PETE Smet Recycling now 
selling used cars & trucks. 
Will trade. Call Pete, 307-
347-2528. Buying scrap vehi-
cles with clear titles! 

Absolute Auto Trailer Parts & 
Sales in Gillette

Largest selection of trailers
 and trailer parts in the region.  
If we don’t have it we’ll find it. 

402 W 1st St. 
Gillette, WY. 307-670-0919

Real Transparency, 
Real Democracy

78%
Of Wyoming adults read 

PUBLIC NOTICES  
in print or digital newspapers. 

Public notices enable citizens to monitor actions 
of  government, and serve as watchdogs for 
government offi  cials and private interests.

To learn more, contact your local newspaper 
or the WPA at: 
307.635.3905 • wyopress@wyopress.org

Source: Th e Wyoming Market Study, 2022; by Coda Ventures

Operations
Manager
Dubois, WY

We’re Hiring!

Are you ready to join a team 
leading the industry in technology and

innovation?

Learn More & Apply
range.net/careers
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Last Week’s Answers

CLUES ACROSS
  1. Tropical Asian plant
  5. Yankees’ slugger Judge
 10. Helps to preserve food
 12. Plant disease
 14. One who predicts
 16. Equally
 18. Burundian franc
 19. Pouch
 20. Arizona city
 22. Surround
 23. Hard, heavy timber
 25. Witnessed
 26. They __
 27. French river
 28. A way to drink
 30. Small constellation
 31. Peruse a written work
 33. Type of hound
 35. Plant of the goosefoot family
 37. Evade or escape
 38. A way to confine
 40. Volcanic crater
 41. Weekday
 42. Women’s service organization 

(abbr.)
 44. Local area network
 45. Sensory receptor
 48. Posted
 50. Tibetan pastry
 52. Licensed for Wall Street
 53. Very willing
 55. Golf score
 56. Consume
 57. Touchdown
 58. Tends to remind
 63. In a way, smoothed
 65. Poke holes in the ground
 66. Herbaceous plants
 67. Taiwanese river
 
 CLUES DOWN
  1. Body art
  2. Boxing’s GOAT
  3. Film for posterity (abbr.)
  4. Prayer
  5. Calculating machine
  6. Keyboard key

  7. Outburst
  8. Man-eating giants
  9. New Hampshire
 10. Type of sword
 11. Counting
 13. Pants style
 15. Political action committee
 17. U.S. government legislative 

branch
 18. Civil Rights Act component
 21. Contractors take one
 23. Spanish soldier
 24. A person’s brother or sister
 27. Expressed pleasure
 29. Song of praise 
 32. Shock treatment
 34. Patti HearstÕs captors
 35. Counteract
 36. Goes over again
 39. Popular Dodge truck
 40. Male adult
 43. A part of a river where the 

current is very fast
 44. Rope used to lasso
 46. Become less intense
 47. Subway rodent
 49. Lead alloy
 51. Japanese honorific title
 54. Advise someone
 59. Famous NYC museum
 60. Ocean
 61. Cathode-ray tube
 62. Cologne
 64. It starts with these two


